
We spend a lot of -me poin-ng the 
finger at how other people are 
mess ing up - f rom a lack of 
transparency to a failure to have 
regard to effects on the environement. 
If  we are going to take the moral high 
ground - then we need to be 
scrupulous about the issues that we 
believe are importnant. So, we have 
set out our ethos in this document. 
We will work to ensure we comply 
with this as far as we possibly can. As 
much as is possible, we will also only 
w o r k w i t h c o m p a n i e s a n d 
organsia-ons who align with our 
values. If you think we have dropped 
the ball - tell us: info@taaproject.org.  

T R A N S P A R E N C Y A N D 
ACCOUNTABILITY  

These are two principles that are 
integral to our work. We need to abide 
by them. To this end we will make 
available: 

• Our board mee-ng minutes; and 

• Our accounts; 

Due to regula-ons around privacy and 
data protec-on, it may be necessary 
for some infroma-on to be redacted 
or withheld. But so far as is possible, 
we promise to be as transparent as we 
can. If somethign isn’t available and 
you would like to see it- email us. 

ANIMALS AND THE PLANET 

We want to limit the effect of our 
c h a r i t y o p e r a - o n s o n t h e 
environment. We want to promote 
kindness to animals. All of our 
decisions should give considera-on to  
these issues.  

FAIRNESS AND EQUALITY 

We believe that animal advocacy is 
part of a wider social movememnt 
that seeks to prevent violence, 
exploita-on and oppression of all.  

With this in mind, in advancing our 
agenda we believe it is important to 
work to understand broader social 
jus-ce issues so that our own work 
doesn’t cut across or undermine 
efforts to address these problems. 
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